
Onelogin - Key Services 

Single Sign-On
Sign in once and you’re done.
A single, secure password unlocks 
an SSO portal for single-click access 
to apps for all your users.

Provisioning (User Lifecycle Mgmt.)
Provisioning - Quickly create, 
update, and delete users inside 
supported apps.
Roles and Mappings - Automate and 
simplify the assignment of apps with 
user attributes.
Rules - Assign & manage user 
permissions for all apps.

Multi-Factor Authentication
Protect access to all your apps with 
additional authentication factors.

Protect - Our one-time-password 
(OTP) app, included.

Adaptive - Step it up with machine-
learning.

Desktop
Certificate Authentication - Simplify 
login by eliminating the need to 
enter a password.
Desktop Password Enforcement -
Enforce a strong credential for Mac 
or Windows desktop login without 
AD.

Self-Service Password Reset
OneLogin can reset passwords 
inside of user directories like AD and 
LDAP.

Self-Service - users can reset their 
own passwords, saving our 
customers tons of time and money 
on helpdesk tickets.

Access
OneLogin extends the reach of the 
OneLogin UAM platform to apps 
hosted on-prem for centralized 
management, policy enforcement, 
and a single portal for end-users to 
access all apps.


